

\$58,000.00	1/7/2015		
0040	98000/114-150-50-64	5	WITHDRAWN
98000/114-150-50-64	2003/ 2004		
Lovejoy Catherine J	2009-0603452		
\$59,000.00	10/29/2009		
0043	58006/119-020-29-00	5	WITHDRAWN
58006/119-020-29-00	2007/ 2008		
Nelson Thomas R	2013-0593805		
\$1,300.00	9/30/2013		
0045	75015/121-142-15-00	5	WITHDRAWN
75015/121-142-15-00	2008/ 2009		
Hernandez Noel M	2014-0395962		
\$19,000.00	9/15/2014		
0049	75009/123-081-07-00	5	REDEEMED
75009/123-081-07-00	2008/ 2009		
Moran David T	2014-0395963		
\$8,200.00	9/15/2014		
0052	57121/124-330-16-00	5	REDEEMED
57121/124-330-16-00	2008/ 2009		
Desiderata Inc	2014-0371302		
\$115,000.00	8/28/2014		
0053	57038/124-360-18-00	5	REDEEMED
57038/124-360-18-00	2008/ 2009		
Griffin Mary K	2014-0371723		
\$124,000.00	8/28/2014		
0056	57072/126-370-10-13	5	REDEEMED

57072/126-370-10-13
Ballard Diane P
\$48,000.00

2008/ 2009
2014-0371724
8/28/2014

0057
57019/127-200-26-00
Doring Lisa M
\$45,400.00

57019/127-200-26-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0482909
11/5/2014

5

\$45,400.00 \$50.05 \$10.64 \$28.00 \$1.50 \$443.00 \$236.00 \$0.00 \$40,981.41 \$3,322.43 \$0.00 \$110.00 \$199.00 \$68.02

SOLD
JOANNE HEGARTY
PO BOX 3160 (375 MAIN ST)
PINCHER CREEK, AB CANADA
April 29, 2015 15-0210057

0229
94173/130-180-04-00
Pauma Valley Realty Inc
\$14,900.00

94173/130-180-04-00
2007/ 2008
2014-0394807
9/12/2014

5

\$14,900.00 \$16.50 \$10.64 \$28.00 \$1.50 \$443.00 \$236.00 \$0.00 \$10,374.06 \$1,311.42 \$0.00 \$110.00 \$199.00 \$2,186.38

SOLD
MARTHA CARO
2933 BONITA MESA RD
BONITA, CA 91902
May 4, 2015 15-0218953

0232
94149/132-190-37-00
Canizales Raul
\$218,000.00

94149/132-190-37-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0371725
8/28/2014

5

REDEEMED

0233
94056/133-270-05-00
Salazar Albert
\$52,600.00

94056/133-270-05-00
2006/ 2007
2014-0432968
10/6/2014

5

REDEEMED

0236
94171/134-130-71-00
Carpenter Raymond A
\$9,100.00

94171/134-130-71-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0371303
8/28/2014

5

REDEEMED

0237
94170/134-210-11-00
Hughes 2004 Tr 06-22-04
\$3,000.00

94170/134-210-11-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0395966
9/15/2014

5

REDEEMED

0293	07025/162-501-14-00	5	REDEEMED
07025/162-501-14-00	2008/ 2009		
First Surety Venture Partners	2014-0371315		
\$60,000.00	8/28/2014		
0295	12004/163-331-22-00	5	WITHDRAWN
12219/163-331-22-00	2008/ 2009		
Pacifica Reo L L C	2014-0395975		
\$2,000.00	9/15/2014		
0301	07082/165-362-27-65	5	REDEEMED
07082/165-362-27-65	2008/ 2009		
Ramos Salvador	2014-0383243		
\$70,000.00	9/5/2014		
0303	07076/165-413-06-00	5	REDEEMED
07076/165-413-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Morrow Fam Tr	2014-0383244		
\$16,000.00	9/5/2014		
0305	12004/166-080-71-29	5	REDEEMED
12004/166-080-71-29	2005/ 2006		
Granofsky Eric C	2014-0499967		
\$85,000.00	11/17/2014		
0311	07003/169-381-26-00	5	REDEEMED
07003/169-381-26-00	2008/ 2009		
Carpenter David	2014-0383246		
\$218,000.00	9/5/2014		
0312	96043/170-162-55-00	5	REDEEMED
96043/170-162-55-00	2008/ 2009		
Dowden Fam Tr 12-04-13	2014-0395976		

0370	58019/198-081-04-00	5																	REDEEMED
58019/198-081-04-00	2007/ 2008																		
D H S Development Inc	2013-0599688																		
\$5,500.00	10/2/2013																		
0371	58019/198-081-05-00	5																	REDEEMED
58019/198-081-05-00	2007/ 2008																		
D H S Development Inc	2013-0599689																		
\$5,500.00	10/2/2013																		
0372	58019/198-081-06-00	5																	REDEEMED
58019/198-081-06-00	2007/ 2008																		
D H S Development Inc	2013-0599690																		
\$5,800.00	10/2/2013																		
0373	58019/198-085-03-00	5																	WITHDRAWN
58019/198-085-03-00	2008/ 2009																		
Priest Richard D	2014-0383252																		
\$5,800.00	9/5/2014																		
0378	58019/198-365-11-00	5																	REDEEMED
58019/198-365-11-00	2008/ 2009																		
Monica Real Estate Holdings L	2014-0371322																		
\$3,800.00	8/28/2014																		
0379	58019/198-365-21-00	5	\$4,000.00	\$4.40	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$2,376.76	\$246.47	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$358.63			SOLD
58019/198-365-21-00	2008/ 2009																		AMADOR COLMENAR
Jufer Rita	2014-0395890																		2825 ORO BLANCO CIR
\$4,000.00	9/15/2014																		ESCONDIDO, CA 92027
																			April 29, 2015 15-0210062
0383	58020/198-401-15-00	5	\$5,500.00	\$6.05	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$4,020.05	\$381.80	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$80.01			SOLD
58020/198-401-15-00	2007/ 2008																		CHARLES MILLER

0390 58006/200-020-17-00 Myrdal Peter \$2,900.00	58006/200-020-17-00 2007/ 2008 2013-0597131 10/2/2013	5																NO BID
0391 58031/200-063-19-00 Dier Daniel S \$4,000.00	58031/200-063-19-00 2006/ 2007 2014-0371733 8/28/2014	5																REDEEMED
0392 58031/200-233-17-00 Snodgrass Jesse D \$2,500.00	58031/200-233-17-00 2007/ 2008 2014-0394809 9/12/2014	5																REDEEMED
0393 58031/200-254-11-00 Jeffers Larrell K \$3,300.00	58031/200-254-11-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0371324 8/28/2014	5	\$3,900.00	\$4.40	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$1,909.30	\$195.13	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$777.43		SOLD AMADOR COLMENAR 2825 ORO BLANCO CIR ESCONDIDO, CA 92027 April 29, 2015 15-0210065
0394 58006/201-170-17-00 Olonan Manuel \$2,100.00	58006/201-170-17-00 2007/ 2008 2013-0597136 10/1/2013	5	\$3,900.00	\$4.40	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$1,527.58	\$120.14	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$1,224.14		SOLD MARTIN JESSICA 12389 TOPA HILL CIR LAKESIDE, CA 92040 April 29, 2015 15-0210066
0395 58006/201-180-01-00 Magnus Agnes \$2,500.00	58006/201-180-01-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0371325 8/28/2014	5	\$2,500.00	\$2.75	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$1,361.65	\$135.87	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00		SOLD CASTLE BRIDGE SRVC SERVICES LLC PO BOX 12021 LA JOLLA, CA 92039 April 29, 2015 15-0210067
0396 58006/201-180-20-00 Silverton & Phillippi \$59,000.00	58006/201-180-20-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383253 9/5/2014	5	\$59,000.00	\$64.90	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$12,141.82	\$1,308.74	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$44,521.30		SOLD BRENDON M HALL 856 TAMAYO DR #3 CHULA VISTA, CA 91910 May 4, 2015 15-0218955

0401	09000/205-153-07-00	5	REDEEMED
09000/205-153-07-00	2008/ 2009		
Santayana Fernanco M	2014-0383254		
\$407,000.00	9/5/2014		
0403	09013/209-041-25-18	5	REDEEMED
09013/209-041-25-18	2008/ 2009		
Palmer Way L L C	2014-0383255		
\$125,000.00	9/5/2014		
0404	09013/209-100-16-00	5	REDEEMED
09013/209-100-16-00	2007/ 2008		
J A A B A L L C	2014-0432970		
\$850,000.00	10/6/2014		
0407	09027/214-483-37-00	5	REDEEMED
09027/214-483-37-00	2007/ 2008		
Redburn Karina	2014-0432971		
\$191,000.00	10/6/2014		
0412	09061/215-492-16-00	5	WITHDRAWN
09061/215-492-16-00	1997/ 1998		
Santistevan David R	2003-1153822		
\$67,700.00	9/19/2003		
0416	13203/217-161-15-02	5	REDEEMED
13203/217-161-15-02	2008/ 2009		
Song Billy	2014-0383257		
\$201,000.00	9/5/2014		
0420	13244/218-670-21-00	5	REDEEMED
13244/218-670-21-00	2008/ 2009		
Sentinella Clyde	2014-0383258		

04037/224-483-12-00
Keohane Ramona R
\$82,000.00

2008/ 2009
2014-0383260
9/5/2014

0441
04025/224-690-11-00
Robeson Angela
\$179,000.00

04025/224-690-11-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0383261
9/5/2014

3

REDEEMED

0442
04040/224-780-07-00
Muehl Dawn B
\$67,000.00

04040/224-780-07-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0383262
9/5/2014

3

REDEEMED

0447
04003/226-762-33-00
Smith Dorothy J
\$102,000.00

04003/226-762-33-00
2007/ 2008
2014-0447120
10/15/2014

3

REDEEMED

0450
04285/228-040-32-00
A R X Financial Inc
\$34,800.00

74007/228-040-32-00
2005/ 2006
2011-0588449
11/8/2011

3

NO BID

0451
04285/228-040-33-00
A R X Financial Inc
\$38,200.00

74007/228-040-33-00
2005/ 2006
2011-0588450
11/3/2011

3

NO BID

0452
04013/228-480-02-70
Carrillo Vince
\$35,000.00

04013/228-480-02-70
2008/ 2009
2014-0383263
9/5/2014

3

REDEEMED

0458	04223/233-142-14-00	3	WITHDRAWN
04223/233-142-14-00	2008/ 2009		
City Plaza At Escondido L L C	2014-0383340		
\$2,000,000.00	9/5/2014		
0459	04125/235-201-06-00	3	NO BID
04125/235-201-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Borchard John H	2014-0395894		
\$1,400.00	9/15/2014		
0464	04225/238-152-06-00	3	REDEEMED
04225/238-152-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Cueva Benjamin A Tr	2014-0395895		
\$10,600.00	9/15/2014		
0470	81003/250-020-06-00	2	WITHDRAWN
81003/250-020-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Deutsch Emery	2014-0395896		
\$1,200.00	9/15/2014		
0474	81001/251-200-14-00	2	REDEEMED
81001/251-200-14-00	2008/ 2009		
Taylor Charles	2014-0383341		
\$70,000.00	9/5/2014		
0475	81001/252-080-43-00	2	WITHDRAWN
81001/252-080-43-00	2008/ 2009		
Pedersen Barbara H	2014-0395897		
\$1,200.00	9/15/2014		
0478	58002/253-313-08-00	2	REDEEMED
58002/253-313-08-00	2008/ 2009		
Acosta Marcos	2014-0395898		
\$3,000.00	9/15/2014		

0481 58008/253-390-28-00 Burgan Evelyn \$1,200.00	58008/253-390-28-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0395899 9/15/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$168.54	\$8.12	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210068	
0484 09134/255-012-12-00 Ford Mance Co \$13,900.00	09134/255-012-12-00 2007/ 2008 2013-0669399 11/12/2013	5	\$41,000.00	\$45.10	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$9,248.00	\$356.43	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$30,367.43	SOLD ANH THU NU PHAM 11859 TRAIL CREST DR SAN DIEGO, CA 92131 May 4, 2015 15-0218956	
0494 19266/264-173-25-00 Kable Forrest T \$1,400.00	19102/264-173-25-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0499969 11/17/2014	3															WITHDRAWN	
0495 71007/264-381-23-00 Dutt Pranab K & Shefali S Rev \$1,700.00	71007/264-381-23-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0395900 9/15/2014	5															REDEEMED	
0496 19377/264-390-25-00 Reihm Robert R \$635,000.00	19377/264-390-25-00 2006/ 2007 2014-0432973 10/6/2014	3															REDEEMED	
0502 87179/268-360-15-00 D R E C 0308 L L C \$20,900.00	87179/268-360-15-00 2004/ 2005 2011-0543939 10/17/2011	5	\$160,000.00	\$176.00	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$18,649.04	\$937.54	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$139,395.28	SOLD ANH THU NU PHAM 11859 TRAIL CREST DR SAN DIEGO, CA 92131 May 4, 2015 15-0218957	
0504 74004/272-043-04-00	74004/272-043-04-00 2008/ 2009	3	\$32,500.00	N/A	\$10.64	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$4,994.85	DEFAULTED SALE Deferred Payment Agreeemnt

0519 65010/282-342-27-00 Ryon Jennifer K \$11,700.00	65010/282-342-27-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0395905 9/15/2014	2	\$11,700.00	\$13.20	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$9,651.91	\$1,038.30	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00	SOLD AMADOR COLMENAR 2825 ORO BLANCO CIR ESCONDIDO, CA 92027 May 4, 2015 15-0218959
0522 65023/286-021-06-00 W H R Properties Inc \$919,000.00	65023/286-021-06-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383347 9/5/2014	2															REDEEMED
0523 65023/286-021-08-00 W H R Properties Inc \$26,000.00	65023/286-021-08-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0395906 9/15/2014	2															REDEEMED
0525 65023/286-170-03-00 Morrow Terry \$525,000.00	65023/286-170-03-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383348 9/5/2014	2															WITHDRAWN
0531 81035/289-350-38-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,600.00	81035/289-350-38-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368691 8/27/2014	2															WITHDRAWN
0532 81035/290-040-10-00 Hodges - Holtzen Megan \$1,200.00	81035/290-040-10-00 2007/ 2008 2013-0669477 11/12/2013	2															WITHDRAWN
0534 81013/291-274-06-00 Nelson Edward A Est Of \$1,200.00	81013/291-274-06-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368692 8/27/2014	2	\$2,600.00	\$3.30	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$236.06	\$15.09	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$1,330.71	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210070

\$1,200.00	8/27/2014																		
0545	81027/293-112-12-00	2																	WITHDRAWN
81027/293-112-12-00	2006/ 2007																		
Hidden Oaks Meadow Tr	2013-0669488																		
\$1,700.00	11/12/2013																		
0546	81027/293-123-47-00	2																	REDEEMED
81027/293-123-47-00	2007/ 2008																		
Haddock Delmar D	2014-0394810																		
\$14,900.00	9/12/2014																		
0547	81027/293-142-05-00	2	\$2,000.00	\$2.20	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$576.28	\$52.31	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$343.27			SOLD
81027/293-142-05-00	2008/ 2009																		PASQUALE OLIVERI
Tom Katherine C Est Of	2014-0368698																		P.O. BOX 54
\$1,800.00	8/27/2014																		BONITA, CA 91908
																			April 29, 2015 15-0210074
0548	81027/293-142-06-00	2	\$2,100.00	\$2.75	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$576.28	\$52.31	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$443.27			SOLD
81027/293-142-06-00	2008/ 2009																		PASQUALE OLIVERI
Tom Katherine C Est Of	2014-0368699																		P.O. BOX 54
\$1,700.00	8/27/2014																		BONITA, CA 91908
																			April 29, 2015 15-0210075
0549	81027/293-142-08-00	2	\$1,700.00	\$2.20	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$254.00	\$17.22	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$400.64			SOLD
81027/293-142-08-00	2008/ 2009																		PASQUALE OLIVERI
Tom Katherine C Est Of	2014-0368700																		P.O. BOX 54
\$1,700.00	8/27/2014																		BONITA, CA 91908
																			April 29, 2015 15-0210076
0550	81027/293-142-09-00	2	\$1,300.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$235.00	\$15.09	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$21.15			SOLD
81027/293-142-09-00	2008/ 2009																		PASQUALE OLIVERI
Tom Katherine C Est Of	2014-0368701																		P.O. BOX 54
\$1,300.00	8/27/2014																		BONITA, CA 91908
																			April 29, 2015 15-0210077
0551	81027/293-142-10-00	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$235.00	\$15.09	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD

81027/293-142-10-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	2008/ 2009 2014-0368702 8/27/2014																		PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210078
0552 81027/293-142-11-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-11-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368703 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210079
0553 81027/293-142-14-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-14-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368704 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$235.62	\$15.09	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210080
0554 81027/293-142-16-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-16-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368705 8/27/2014	2																	WITHDRAWN
0555 81027/293-142-17-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-17-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368706 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0210081
0556 81027/293-142-18-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-18-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368707 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209510
0557 81027/293-142-19-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-19-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368708 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00			SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209511

0558 81027/293-142-20-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-20-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368709 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209512
0559 81027/293-142-21-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-142-21-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368710 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209513
0560 81027/293-142-22-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$2,000.00	81027/293-142-22-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368711 8/27/2014	2	\$3,600.00	\$4.40	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$614.08	\$56.46	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$1,901.32	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209514
0561 81027/293-143-03-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,200.00	81027/293-143-03-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368712 8/27/2014	2	\$1,200.00	\$1.65	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$197.06	\$11.02	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209515
0562 81027/293-143-04-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,500.00	81027/293-143-04-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368713 8/27/2014	2	\$3,900.00	\$4.40	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$424.48	\$35.78	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$2,411.60	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209516
0563 81027/293-143-05-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,300.00	81027/293-143-05-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368714 8/27/2014	2	\$2,300.00	\$2.75	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$291.96	\$21.31	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$958.59	SOLD PASQUALE OLIVERI P.O. BOX 54 BONITA, CA 91908 April 29, 2015 15-0209517
0564 81027/293-143-06-00 Tom Katherine C Est Of \$1,400.00	81027/293-143-06-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0368715 8/27/2014	2	\$3,000.00	\$3.30	\$10.64	\$28.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$310.58	\$23.39	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$1,637.89	SOLD COMSTOCK RANDALL 3228 GLENN ABBEY CHULA VISTA, CA 91910

\$4,500.00	11/7/2013																		
0660	82012/394-132-16-00	2																	REDEEMED
82012/394-132-16-00	2008/ 2009																		
Wojtasinski Stanley	2014-0395912																		
\$16,100.00	9/15/2014																		
0662	82040/395-152-28-86	2																	REDEEMED
82040/395-152-28-86	2008/ 2009																		
Martin Vincent A	2014-0395913																		
\$16,700.00	9/15/2014																		
0665	59114/398-090-12-00	2																	NO BID
59114/398-090-12-00	2004/ 2005																		
Environmental Tr Inc	2012-0671519																		
\$69,100.00	10/30/2012																		
0667	82051/398-240-91-00	2																	NO BID
82051/398-240-91-00	2008/ 2009																		
Walker Steven C	2014-0394811																		
\$1,800.00	9/12/2014																		
0669	51063/399-230-03-00	2	\$2,300.00	\$2.75	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$437.56	\$28.22	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$816.08			SOLD
51063/399-230-03-00	2008/ 2009																		SHORE TONY JASON
Kosirog Janice L	2014-0371664																		5331 VIRGINIA AVE
\$1,500.00	8/28/2014																		LOS ANGELES, CA 90029
																			April 29, 2015 15-0209524
0672	51063/399-230-24-00	2																	WITHDRAWN
51063/399-230-24-00	2007/ 2008																		
M & W Developers Corp	2013-0664337																		
\$6,500.00	11/7/2013																		
0673	51063/399-240-25-00	2	\$2,800.00	\$3.30	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$397.37	\$27.74	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$1,356.75			SOLD

Zimmerle Fam Tr 07-01-96
\$133,000.00

2014-0383691
9/5/2014

0711 08100/434-032-35-65 **3**
08100/434-032-35-65 2008/ 2009
Gonzalez David 2014-0383692
\$35,000.00 9/5/2014

WITHDRAWN

0712 08001/437-110-06-00 **4**
08001/437-110-06-00 2008/ 2009
Peters Edwin L Tr (dcsd) 2014-0383693
\$21,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0713 08001/437-130-09-00 **4**
08001/437-130-09-00 2008/ 2009
Aussie Homes Corp 2014-0499971
\$10,700.00 11/17/2014

\$10,700.00 \$12.10 \$10.64 \$28.00 \$1.50 \$443.00 \$236.00 \$0.00 \$8,053.92 \$826.26 \$0.00 \$110.00 \$199.00 \$791.68

SOLD
PASQUALE OLIVERI
P.O. BOX 54
BONITA, CA 91908
April 29, 2015 15-0209527

0714 08001/437-580-06-00 **4**
08001/437-580-06-00 2008/ 2009
Diaz Gallego Fam L L C 2014-0383694
\$217,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0718 08001/440-110-18-00 **4**
08001/440-110-18-00 2008/ 2009
Worst Charles A 2014-0383695
\$275,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0723 08256/441-581-13-00 **4**
08256/441-581-13-00 2008/ 2009
Pond Russell 2014-0383696
\$473,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0724 08001/443-040-18-20 Yasnaei Farni \$88,000.00	08001/443-040-18-20 2008/ 2009 2014-0383697 9/5/2014	4	\$170,000.00	\$187.00	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$193.00	\$17,159.33	\$2,196.45	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$149,433.08	SOLD ANH THU NU PHAM 11859 TRAIL CREST DR SAN DIEGO, CA 92131 May 4, 2015 15-0218847
0725 08001/443-040-18-44 Yasna Farni \$60,000.00	08001/443-040-18-44 2008/ 2009 2014-0383698 9/5/2014	4	\$140,000.00	\$154.00	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$11,450.23	\$1,515.57	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$126,016.06	SOLD ROMMEL ARUIZU RASHID 345 MOSS ST SUITE 6 CHULA VISTA, CA 91911 May 4, 2015 15-0218965
0728 08255/445-092-02-00 4677 Idaho L L C \$608,000.00	08255/445-092-02-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383699 9/5/2014	4															REDEEMED
0729 08001/445-102-18-00 Smith Judy \$1,800.00	08001/445-102-18-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0371671 8/28/2014	4															NO BID
0731 08255/445-682-03-00 Rostron Charles \$157,000.00	08255/445-682-03-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383700 9/5/2014	4															REDEEMED
0733 08001/446-023-15-00 Leon Jose F \$72,000.00	08001/446-023-15-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0383701 9/5/2014	4															REDEEMED
0735 08255/446-431-35-29 3939 Illinois L L C \$46,000.00	08255/446-431-35-29 2005/ 2006 2011-0544342 10/17/2011	4	\$130,000.00	\$143.00	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$16,105.32	\$1,170.43	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$111,706.11	SOLD CLAUDIA FLORES, TTEE 24094 VIA VISTA VALENCIA, CA 91354 May 4, 2015 15-0218966

0738	08241/447-320-07-00	4	REDEEMED
08241/447-320-07-00	2008/ 2009		
Nguyen Cindy Separate Proper	2014-0383703		
\$290,000.00	9/5/2014		
0747	08001/452-705-05-07	4	WITHDRAWN
08001/452-705-05-07	2007/ 2008		
Samuels Andrew J	2013-0664876		
\$111,000.00	11/7/2013		
0756	08001/455-160-01-31	3	REDEEMED
08001/455-160-01-31	2008/ 2009		
Kuhl Regina M	2014-0383704		
\$160,000.00	9/5/2014		
0760	05003/464-020-36-30	2	REDEEMED
05003/464-020-36-30	2008/ 2009		
Munguia H David	2014-0383705		
\$51,000.00	9/5/2014		
0762	08241/471-322-12-07	4	REDEEMED
08241/471-322-12-07	2008/ 2009		
City Redevelopment L L C	2014-0384092		
\$42,000.00	9/5/2014		
0763	08241/471-482-19-00	4	REDEEMED
08241/471-482-19-00	2006/ 2007		
Francis Lloyd G Tr 06-06-96	2014-0432978		
\$150,000.00	10/6/2014		
0768	05013/474-581-01-00	2	REDEEMED
05013/474-581-01-00	2008/ 2009		
La Mesa Nine Diamonds L L C	2014-0384093		

\$1,172,000.00

9/5/2014

0769 05013/475-301-22-00 2
05013/475-301-22-00 2007/ 2008
Wardley Development Inc 2013-0664905
\$0.00 11/7/2013

WITHDRAWN

0774 15002/478-180-32-00 2
15002/478-180-42-00 2006/ 2007
Windle Development Co L L C 2013-0664909
\$11,000.00 11/7/2013

REDEEMED

0775 08024/478-271-13-00 4
08024/478-271-13-00 2008/ 2009
Brown Oredia R Est Of 2014-0384094
\$129,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0776 08024/478-281-03-00 4
08024/478-281-03-00 2008/ 2009
Penny Michael E 2014-0384095
\$59,000.00 9/5/2014

REDEEMED

0778 15002/479-230-03-00 2
15002/479-230-03-00 2007/ 2008
Jackson Janet 2014-0432979
\$160,000.00 10/6/2014

REDEEMED

0780 15002/479-420-48-00 2
15002/479-420-48-00 2007/ 2008
Edwards Floyd Jr 2013-0664912
\$2,000.00 11/7/2013

WITHDRAWN

0783 03006/481-430-29-00 2

REDEEMED

03006/481-430-29-00	2008/ 2009		
Thifault Audrey	2014-0384096		
\$150,000.00	9/5/2014		
0784	03188/483-340-44-17	2	REDEEMED
03188/483-340-44-17	2008/ 2009		
Witty Jill	2014-0384097		
\$73,000.00	9/5/2014		
0785	59140/484-110-01-00	2	WITHDRAWN
59140/484-110-01-00	2006/ 2007		
Sanchez Jose L	2014-0427521		
\$225,000.00	10/1/2014		
0788	05011/486-344-03-00	2	WITHDRAWN
05011/486-344-03-00	2007/ 2008		
Amaya Villas Ltd	2013-0664915		
\$1,900.00	11/7/2013		
0793	03003/489-264-01-00	2	REDEEMED
03003/489-264-01-00	2008/ 2009		
Hintz Josephine P Fam Tr 08	2014-0384098		
\$141,000.00	9/5/2014		
0794	05011/490-592-44-00	2	REDEEMED
05011/490-592-44-00	2008/ 2009		
Marie Savio L L C	2014-0384099		
\$395,000.00	9/5/2014		
0795	03001/491-380-21-00	2	NO BID
03001/491-380-21-00	2008/ 2009		
Ramirez Eduardo	2014-0394815		
\$2,600.00	9/12/2014		

0815	59488/502-293-02-43	2	REDEEMED
59488/502-293-02-43	2008/ 2009		
Dowell Charles T	2014-0384104		
\$105,000.00	9/5/2014		
0818	83108/503-280-60-00	2	REDEEMED
83108/503-280-60-00	2008/ 2009		
Seedorf Don J Trust 01-24-05	2014-0384105		
\$71,000.00	9/5/2014		
0819	15012/503-460-23-00	2	REDEEMED
15012/503-460-23-00	2008/ 2009		
Dibernardo Joseph G Jr	2014-0384106		
\$32,000.00	9/5/2014		
0820	15028/503-481-42-00	2	REDEEMED
15028/503-481-42-00	2008/ 2009		
L G Environmental Prop Inc	2014-0371673		
\$20,500.00	8/28/2014		
0828	59263/506-071-42-00	2	NO BID
59263/506-071-42-00	2007/ 2008		
Toma Hani	2013-0664818		
\$27,900.00	11/7/2013		
0832	59005/509-134-01-00	2	NO BID
59005/509-134-01-00	2008/ 2009		
Carolino Josefa P	2014-0371674		
\$26,800.00	8/28/2014		
0833	59005/509-150-51-00	2	NO BID
59005/509-150-51-00	2008/ 2009		

Lakner James S	2014-0499972		
\$181,500.00	11/17/2014		
0834	59005/509-272-06-00	2	REDEEMED
59005/509-272-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Wilson Russell J	2014-0384109		
\$72,000.00	9/5/2014		
0835	67018/510-081-08-00	2	REDEEMED
67018/510-081-08-00	2007/ 2009		
Imagination Construction Co	2014-0432981		
\$465,000.00	10/6/2014		
0836	67018/510-081-11-00	2	NO BID
67018/510-081-13-00	2007/ 2009		
Imagination Construction Co	2013-06648222		
\$18,600.00	11/7/2013		
0839	03092/511-301-09-00	2	REDEEMED
03092/511-301-09-00	2008/ 2009		
Finneran Joseph	2014-0384110		
\$75,000.00	9/5/2014		
0848	79011/519-100-05-00	2	NO BID
79011/519-100-05-00	2005/ 2006		
Abood Michong	2011-0588411		
\$14,100.00	11/3/2011		
0849	79011/519-100-17-00	2	NO BID
79011/519-100-17-00	2005/ 2006		
Abood Michong	2011-0588412		
\$12,000.00	11/3/2011		

\$32,000.00	10/24/2012		
0885	08001/540-420-08-00	4	REDEEMED
08001/540-420-08-00	2008/ 2009		
Makul Anthony C	2014-0385330		
\$29,000.00	9/8/2014		
0889	08001/541-633-14-00	1	REDEEMED
08001/541-633-14-00	2008/ 2009		
Ruvalcaba Carlos	2014-0371677		
\$3,500.00	8/28/2014		
0892	08001/544-032-44-00	4	REDEEMED
08001/544-032-44-00	2008/ 2009		
Pham Luan V	2014-0394821		
\$14,000.00	9/12/2014		
0893	08001/544-063-26-00	4	REDEEMED
08001/544-063-26-00	2008/ 2009		
Salgado Moises F	2014-0385332		
\$100,000.00	9/8/2014		
0896	08001/544-213-24-00	4	REDEEMED
08001/544-213-24-00	2008/ 2009		
Orcutt Isabel L Est Of	2014-0371678		
\$11,000.00	8/28/2014		
0902	08200/546-072-10-00	1	WITHDRAWN
08200/546-072-10-00	2008/ 2009		
Harrison James B	2014-0385333		
\$83,000.00	9/8/2014		
0903	08001/548-123-11-00	4	REDEEMED

0947	01000/569-071-06-00	1	WITHDRAWN
01000/569-071-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Tefft Patricia A Est Of	2014-0385342		
\$155,000.00	9/8/2014		
0948	01000/569-343-01-00	1	REDEEMED
01000/569-343-01-00	2008/ 2009		
Quintero Nestor	2014-0385343		
\$159,000.00	9/8/2014		
0950	01000/571-132-08-00	1	REDEEMED
01000/571-132-08-00	2008/ 2009		
Romero Fam Tr	2014-0385344		
\$23,000.00	9/8/2014		
0951	01091/573-110-02-00	1	REDEEMED
01091/573-110-02-00	2008/ 2009		
Lawrence Paul F	2014-0385345		
\$137,000.00	9/8/2014		
0952	01000/573-303-05-00	1	REDEEMED
01000/573-303-05-00	2006/ 2007		
Fernandez Victor	2014-0432984		
\$89,000.00	10/6/2014		
0960	83171/578-012-82-00	2	WITHDRAWN
83171/578-012-82-00	2008/ 2009		
Tran Paul D	2014-0375686		
\$1,500.00	9/2/2014		
0962	83052/579-042-07-00	2	REDEEMED
83052/579-042-07-00	2008/ 2009		

0985	08001/583-050-09-00	2		REDEEMED
08001/583-050-09-00	2008/ 2009			
Cruz Roberto	2014-0385350			
\$0.00	9/8/2014			
0987	83037/583-643-02-00	2		REDEEMED
83037/583-643-02-00	2008/ 2009			
Aguilar Ana	2014-0385351			
\$140,000.00	9/8/2014			
0989	83005/584-330-39-00	2		REDEEMED
83005/584-330-39-00	2006/ 2007			
Leviee L L C	2013-0666053			
\$45,000.00	11/7/2013			
0990	83005/584-340-48-00	2		REDEEMED
83005/584-340-48-00	2006/ 2007			
Billl Tan Investments Inc	2013-0666054			
\$55,000.00	11/7/2013			
0995	08001/587-192-04-00	1		REDEEMED
08001/587-192-04-00	2008/ 2009			
Delgadillo Valentina	2014-0375694			
\$3,500.00	9/2/2014			
0996	08001/587-192-13-00	1		REDEEMED
08001/587-192-13-00	2008/ 2009			
Delgadillo Valentina	2014-0385352			
\$3,500.00	9/8/2014			
0997	08001/587-192-30-00	1		REDEEMED
08001/587-192-30-00	2008/2009			
Delgadillo Tr 10-13-06	2014-0385409			

79002/602-130-32-00
Phaler Karl J
\$30,000.00

2005/ 2006
2011-0588352
11/3/2011

1026
91045/606-034-38-00
Ofstedahl & Jackson Corp
\$7,700.00

91045/606-034-38-00
2007/ 2008
2014-0371738
8/28/2014

2

REDEEMED

1029
91052/609-076-16-00
Conn David L
\$30,000.00

91052/609-076-16-00
2007/ 2008
2014-0432986
10/6/2014

2

REDEEMED

1030
91052/609-081-32-00
Family
\$1,100.00

91052/609-081-32-00
2007/ 2008
2013-0666084
11/7/2013

2

WITHDRAWN

1031
91052/609-172-06-00
Kum Gerd
\$8,500.00

91052/609-172-06-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0394826
9/12/2014

2

NO BID

1033
91029/614-120-34-00
Tom Katherine C Est Of
\$1,300.00

91029/614-120-34-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0375695
9/2/2014

2

\$2,900.00 \$3.30 \$10.64 \$18.00 \$1.50 \$443.00 \$236.00 \$0.00 \$322.90 \$25.32 \$0.00 \$110.00 \$199.00 \$1,533.64

SOLD
PASQUALE OLIVERI
P.O. BOX 54
BONITA, CA 91908
April 29, 2015 15-0209531

1036
01286/618-162-07-00
Chavez Efrain M
\$160,000.00

01152/618-162-07-00
2008/ 2009
2014-0385414
9/8/2014

1

REDEEMED

1038	01231/619-280-42-00	1	REDEEMED
01291/619-280-42-00	2008/ 2009		
Godinez Jose A	2014-0375696		
\$71,500.00	9/2/2014		
1039	01231/619-280-43-00	1	REDEEMED
01291/619-280-43-00	2008/ 2009		
Godinez Jose A	2014-0385415		
\$392,000.00	9/8/2014		
1046	01158/624-032-69-00	1	NO BID
01158/624-032-69-00	2008/ 2009		
Sycamore Jackson Estates L P	2014-0375697		
\$1,500.00	9/2/2014		
1050	14018/625-192-22-00	1	WITHDRAWN
14018/625-192-22-00	2008/ 2009		
Walston Family Surviv Tr 08	2014-0385416		
\$25,000.00	9/8/2014		
1055	14009/627-111-19-00	1	REDEEMED
14009/627-111-19-00	2008/ 2009		
Moreno Juan M I I I	2014-0375698		
\$107,000.00	9/2/2014		
1057	08048/629-293-11-00	1	REDEEMED
08048/629-293-11-00	2008/ 2009		
Riedel Fernando	2014-0385417		
\$165,000.00	9/8/2014		
1064	08073/631-112-18-00	1	REDEEMED
08281/631-112-18-00	2008/ 2009		
Yniguez Humberto	2014-0482906		
\$143,000.00	11/5/2014		

1070	08035/633-381-26-00	1	WITHDRAWN
08035/633-381-26-00	2008/ 2009		
Fryer Jill S	2014-0385420		
\$150,000.00	9/8/2014		
1075	08087/637-155-03-00	1	REDEEMED
08087/637-155-03-00	2008/ 2009		
Azurin Ger & Mary Tr 01-16-01	2014-0385421		
\$112,000.00	9/8/2014		
1076	08247/638-020-61-00	1	REDEEMED
08247/638-020-61-00	2007/ 2008		
Brown Sonny & Barbara Fam T	2014-0432987		
\$27,500.00	10/6/2014		
1077	08247/638-041-23-00	1	WITHDRAWN
08247/638-041-23-00	2007/ 2008		
Valverde Norma	2013-0664778		
\$87,000.00	11/7/2013		
1081	01246/641-190-09-00	1	REDEEMED
01246/641-190-09-00	2008/ 2009		
Gonzalez Steven R	2014-0385424		
\$217,000.00	9/8/2014		
1082	01265/642-440-06-00	1	REDEEMED
01265/642-440-06-00	2008/ 2009		
Beltran Mario J	2014-0385425		
\$335,000.00	9/8/2014		
1083	01265/642-490-45-00	1	REDEEMED
01265/642-490-45-00	2008/ 2009		

Dejesus Reynaldo P \$233,000.00	2014-0385426 9/8/2014		
1087 01221/643-380-20-15 Baltazar Gerardo A \$115,000.00	01221/643-380-20-15 2008/ 2009 2014-0385427 9/8/2014	1	REDEEMED
1090 01265/643-610-37-12 Soria Haydee K \$120,000.00	01265/643-610-37-12 2008/ 2009 2014-0385428 9/8/2014	1	REDEEMED
1092 01265/644-300-08-00 Otay Ranch Twelve L L C \$19,600.00	01265/644-300-08-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0375699 9/2/2014	1	REDEEMED
1093 01265/644-300-09-00 Otay Ranch Twelve L L C \$26,600.00	01265/644-300-09-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0375700 9/2/2014	1	REDEEMED
1094 01265/644-301-01-00 Otay Ranch Twelve L L C \$19,800.00	01265/644-301-01-00 2008/2009 2014-0375701 9/2/2014	1	REDEEMED
1095 01265/644-301-02-00 Otay Ranch Twelve L L C \$19,800.00	01265/644-301-02-00 2008/ 2009 2014-0375702 9/2/2014	1	REDEEMED

1111	08070/645-071-07-00	1	REDEEMED
08070/645-071-07-00	2005/ 2006		
Delrio Ricardo	2014-0371740		
\$12,200.00	8/28/2014		
1112	08070/645-074-15-00	1	NO BID
08070/645-074-15-00	2008/ 2009		
Cardoza Jose P	2014-0385429		
\$62,000.00	9/8/2014		
1114	08070/645-076-25-03	1	NO BID
08070/645-076-25-03	2005/ 2009		
Songbird Tr 10-09-06	2013-0664790		
\$8,300.00	11/7/2013		
1115	08070/645-090-23-00	1	NO BID
08070/645-090-23-00	2008/ 2009		
Robles Jose D J I I I	2014-0371741		
\$39,400.00	8/28/2014		
1117	08070/645-270-61-00	1	REDEEMED
08070/645-270-61-00	2008/ 2009		
Tocco Victor	2014-0385430		
\$195,000.00	9/8/2014		
1118	08070/645-280-25-34	1	REDEEMED
08070/645-280-25-34	2008/ 2009		
Alvarez Carlos	2014-0385431		
\$224,000.00	9/8/2014		
1120	08216/646-160-10-00	1	WITHDRAWN
08216/646-160-10-00	2006/ 2007		
Otay Adejo Properties L L C	2014-0499974		

\$725,000.00

11/17/2014

1121 08216/646-161-20-07 **1** REDEEMED
08216/646-161-20-07 2008/ 2009
Herrera Cuauhtemoc P 2014-0385432
\$50,000.00 9/8/2014

1122 08216/646-161-21-01 **1** REDEEMED
08216/646-161-21-01 2008/ 2009
Herrera Cuauhtemoc P 2014-0385433
\$50,000.00 9/8/2014

1123 91045/652-060-36-00 **2** REDEEMED
91045/652-060-36-00 2008/ 2009
Waybreen Tr 10-10-94 2014-0394827
\$7,000.00 9/12/2014

1126 91001/655-090-11-00 **2** WITHDRAWN
91001/655-090-11-00 2008/ 2009
Peak Wendall Est Of 2014-0383855
\$75,000.00 9/5/2014

1127 91001/656-070-17-00 **2** REDEEMED
91001/656-070-17-00 2008/ 2009
Dunstan John R 2014-0394828
\$10,500.00 9/12/2014

1128 91052/658-040-11-00 **2** NO BID
91052/658-040-11-00 2007/ 2008
Miller Robert E 2013-0671903
\$235,500.00 11/13/2013

1130 91029/660-030-03-00 **2** NO BID

2020	07095/147-264-23-09	5		NO BID
07095/147-264-23-09	2006/ 2007			
Boyle Wanda C	2012-0675998			
\$2,000.00	10/31/2012			
2032	07095/147-264-41-08	5		NO BID
07095/147-264-41-08	2005/ 2006			
White Beverly J	2011-0487295			
\$2,100.00	9/20/2011			
2034	07095/150-264-07-04	5		NO BID
07095/150-264-07-04	2006/ 2007			
Young Mary N Tr	2012-0676003			
\$1,600.00	10/31/2012			
2035	07095/150-264-07-32	5		NO BID
07095/150-264-07-32	2008/ 2009			
Romero Dino	2014-0385488			
\$1,700.00	9/8/2014			
2036	07095/150-264-09-41	5		REDEEMED
07095/150-264-09-41	2008/ 2009			
Rahn Terilyn D	2014-0384246			
\$1,400.00	9/5/2014			
2037	07095/150-264-15-03	5		NO BID
07095/150-264-15-03	2008/ 2009			
Timeshare Trade Ins L L C	2014-0384247			
\$1,500.00	9/5/2014			
2038	07095/150-264-24-02	5		REDEEMED
07095/150-264-24-02	2008/ 2009			

2365	09027/215-813-10-12	5	NO BID
09027/215-813-10-12	2005/ 2006		
Milder Larry I	2011-0519000		
\$4,500.00	10/4/2011		
2366	09027/215-813-10-13	5	NO BID
09027/215-813-10-13	2006/ 2007		
Milder Larry I	2012-0675903		
\$4,000.00	10/31/2012		
2367	09027/215-813-10-25	5	NO BID
09027/215-813-10-25	2005/ 2006		
Milder Larry I	2011-0519001		
\$4,400.00	10/4/2011		
2368	09027/215-813-10-26	5	NO BID
09027/215-813-10-26	2006/ 2007		
Milder Larry I	2012-0675904		
\$4,100.00	10/31/2012		
2379	09027/215-814-14-20	5	NO BID
09027/215-814-14-20	2005/ 2006		
Chang Harold S	2011-0519002		
\$3,700.00	10/4/2011		
2380	09027/215-814-14-21	5	NO BID
09027/215-814-14-21	2005/ 2006		
Chang Harold S	2011-0484869		
\$3,700.00	9/19/2011		
2382	09027/215-815-07-14	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-815-07-14	2005/ 2006		
Cipriani Jamie	2011-0484871		
\$3,900.00	9/19/2011		

2385	09027/215-815-19-19	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-815-19-19	2005/ 2006		
Beswetherick John	2012-0675909		
\$3,700.00	10/31/2012		
2388	09027/215-816-14-42	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-816-14-42	2008/ 2009		
Saja Leon			
\$0.00			
2389	09027/215-816-14-43	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-816-14-43	2008/ 2009		
Saja Leon	2014-0387565		
\$0.00	9/9/2014		
2390	09027/215-816-14-44	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-816-14-44	2008/ 2009		
Saja Leon	2014-0387566		
\$0.00	9/9/2014		
2391	09027/215-816-14-45	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-816-14-45	2008/ 2009		
Saja Leon	2014-0387567		
\$0.00	9/9/2014		
2392	09027/215-817-08-50	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-817-08-50	2005/ 2006		
Dromore Tr 09-05-79	2011-0484874		
\$0.00	9/19/2011		
2393	09027/215-817-08-51	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-817-08-51	2005/ 2006		
Dromore Tr 09-05-79	2011-0484875		

\$0.00	9/19/2011		
2395	09027/215-819-16-39	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-819-16-39	2006/ 2007		
Aghajanian Norik & Aspram Re	2012-0675912		
\$0.00	10/31/2012		
2398	09027/215-943-35-16	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-943-35-16	2006/ 2007		
Schroeder Jason	2012-0675914		
\$0.00	10/31/2012		
2399	09027/215-943-39-07	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-943-39-07	2005/ 2006		
Henslee - Downey Jean	2011-0484883		
\$4,300.00	9/19/2011		
2400	09027/215-943-39-08	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-943-39-08	2005/ 2006		
Henslee - Downey Jean	2011-0484884		
\$4,300.00	9/19/2011		
2401	09027/215-943-39-09	5	REDEEMED
09027/215-943-39-09	2005/ 2006		
Henslee - Downey Jean	2011-0484885		
\$4,300.00	9/19/2011		
2402	09027/215-945-38-04	5	NO BID
09027/215-945-38-04	2005/ 2006		
Coen Chris A	2011-0484887		
\$4,300.00	9/19/2011		
2403	09027/215-945-38-05	5	NO BID

09027/215-945-38-05
Coen Chris A
\$4,300.00

2005/ 2006
2011-0484888
9/19/2011

2404
09027/215-946-37-19
Culver Stuart
\$4,500.00

09027/215-946-37-19
2005/ 2006
2011-0484890
9/19/2011

5

NO BID

2609
18013/298-213-02-82
Hawes Roland J
\$2,100.00

18013/298-213-02-82
2006/ 2007
2012-0674761
10/31/2012

3

NO BID

2617
18013/298-213-04-24
Jaramillo Lydia D
\$2,000.00

18013/298-213-04-24
2006/ 2007
2012-0674762
10/31/2012

3

NO BID

2618
18013/298-213-04-46
Estrada Kenneth
\$2,100.00

18013/298-213-04-46
2005/ 2006
2011-0550424
10/19/2011

3

NO BID

2620
18013/298-213-04-76
Szasz Stephen
\$2,000.00

18013/298-213-04-76
2006/ 2007
2012-0674763
10/31/2012

3

NO BID

2625
18013/298-213-05-52
Hawes Roland J
\$1,800.00

18013/298-213-05-52
2006/ 2007
2012-0674764
10/31/2012

3

NO BID

2640	18013/298-213-07-20	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-07-20	2006/ 2007			
Horn Manfred H	2012-0674765			
\$2,000.00	10/31/2012			
2644	18013/298-213-07-52	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-07-52	2006/ 2007			
Romero Teresa Liv Tr 10-16-	2012-0674766			
\$2,000.00	10/31/2012			
2645	18013/298-213-07-57	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-07-57	2006/ 2007			
Nielsen Esther M	2012-0674767			
\$1,800.00	10/31/2012			
2647	18013/298-213-07-81	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-07-81	2006/ 2007			
Barnes Raymond A	2012-0674768			
\$2,100.00	10/31/2012			
2649	18013/298-213-08-17	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-08-17	2006/ 2007			
Cummings Alan E	2012-0671946			
\$2,000.00	10/30/2012			
2650	18013/298-213-08-18	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-08-18	2006/ 2007			
Cummings Alan E	2012-0671947			
\$2,000.00	10/30/2012			
2651	18013/298-213-08-73	3		NO BID
18013/298-213-08-73	2006/ 2007			
Miller Kim I	2012-0671948			
\$2,000.00	10/30/2012			

2658 18013/298-213-10-03 Thayer Shirley F Tr \$2,100.00	18013/298-213-10-03 2006/ 2007 2012-0671949 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2668 18013/298-213-11-66 Tippetts Tracy N \$2,200.00	18013/298-213-11-66 2005/ 2006 2011-0550432 10/19/2011	3	NO BID
2675 18013/298-213-14-40 Hawes Roland J \$2,000.00	18013/298-213-14-40 2006/ 2007 2012-0671950 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2676 18013/298-213-15-03 Wood Dee J \$2,100.00	18013/298-213-15-03 2006/ 2007 2012-0671951 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2682 18013/298-213-17-55 Olvera Mark \$1,800.00	18013/298-213-17-55 2006/ 2007 2012-0671952 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2685 18013/298-213-18-32 Hansen Steven L \$2,100.00	18013/298-213-18-32 2006/ 2007 2012-0671953 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2688 18013/298-213-18-68	18013/298-213-18-68 2006/ 2007	3	NO BID

Vacation Solutions L L C
\$2,100.00

2012-0671954
10/30/2012

2689
18013/298-213-18-69
Vacation Solutions L L C
\$2,100.00

18013/298-213-18-69
2006/ 2007
2012-0671955
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2694
18013/298-213-20-23
Travel Connection Inc
\$2,000.00

18013/298-213-20-23
2006/ 2007
2012-0671956
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2699
18013/298-213-21-74
Hussain Tunku F B T
\$2,100.00

18013/298-213-21-74
2006/ 2007
2012-0671957
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2700
18013/298-213-21-78
Henderson Christine
\$2,150.00

18013/298-213-21-78
2006/ 2007
2012-0671958
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2701
18013/298-213-21-79
Henderson Christine
\$2,100.00

18013/298-213-21-79
2006/ 2007
2012-0671959
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2702
18013/298-213-23-28
Kim Dong C. (DCSD)
\$2,300.00

18013/298-213-23-28
2006/ 2007
2012-0671960
10/30/2012

3

NO BID

2703 18013/298-213-23-61 Arnold Steven T \$1,850.00	18013/298-213-23-61 2007/ 2008 2013-0673939 11/14/2013	3	NO BID
2706 18013/298-213-24-28 Oehler Barbara B \$2,300.00	18013/298-213-24-28 2006/ 2007 2012-0671962 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2713 18013/298-213-28-25 Judd Garrison \$2,250.00	18013/298-213-28-25 2006/ 2007 2012-0671963 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2718 18013/298-213-31-19 Adkins Paul L (DCSD) \$2,200.00	18013/298-213-31-19 2006/ 2007 2012-0671964 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2722 18013/298-213-31-52 Feinman Barry S \$2,250.00	18013/298-213-31-52 2006/ 2007 2012-0671965 10/30/2012	3	NO BID
2723 18013/298-213-31-72 Perry John C \$1,950.00	18013/298-213-31-72 2008/ 2009 2014-0394853 9/12/2014	3	NO BID
2724 18013/298-213-31-73 Perry John C \$1,950.00	18013/298-213-31-73 2008/ 2009 2014-0395942 9/15/2014	3	NO BID

3015	08001/350-400-49-16	4																NO BID
08001/350-400-49-16	2007/ 2008																	
Geier Janice B	2013-0677271																	
\$1,700.00	11/15/2013																	
3018	08001/350-400-50-67	4	\$1,700.00	\$2.20	\$10.64	\$18.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$644.93	\$48.11	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$0.00		SOLD
08001/350-400-50-67	2007/ 2008																	MICHAEL PALLAMARY
Tosches Dawn	2013-0677272																	2754 HAVASUPAI AVE
\$1,700.00	11/15/2013																	SAN DIEGO, CA 92117
																		April 29, 2015 15-0209522
3226	02002/537-571-58-46	1																NO BID
02002/537-571-58-46	2006/ 2007																	
Vigilucci Patricia L	2012-0674736																	
\$2,000.00	10/31/2012																	
3229	02002/537-571-61-13	1																NO BID
02002/537-571-61-13	2006/ 2007																	
Christensen Val J	2012-0674642																	
\$1,650.00	10/31/2012																	
3239	02002/537-572-45-03	1	\$2,200.00	\$2.75	\$10.64	\$21.00	\$1.50	\$443.00	\$236.00	\$0.00	\$1,087.88	\$70.87	\$0.00	\$110.00	\$199.00	\$20.11		SOLD
02002/537-572-45-03	2006/ 2007																	IMAN REZAZADEH
Rubinstein Fernando	2012-0674647																	BAHADORAN
\$2,200.00	10/31/2012																	8819 CAMINITO SUENO
																		LA JOLLA, CA 92037
																		April 29, 2015 15-0209508
3242	02002/537-572-51-13	1																NO BID
02002/537-572-51-13	2006/ 2007																	
Ellis Yvonne D	2013-0675846																	
\$1,550.00	11/14/2013																	

TOTAL NUMBER OF PARCELS = 481

TOTAL NUMBER OF REDEEMED PARCELS = 243

TOTAL NUMBER OF SOLD PARCELS = 85

TOTAL NUMBER OF DFLT PAYMENT AGREEMENTS =2

TOTAL NUMBER OF WITHDRAWN PARCELS = 53

TOTAL NUMBER OF PARCELS WITH NO BIDS = 100

TOTAL NUMBER OF PARCELS CANCELLED = 0